

# Access to Information on the Environment (AIE) Schedule of Records - Summary of Decision Making

AIE Request Reference: AIE 023-013-IFI

Record No.	Date of Record (yyyymmdd)	Brief description of record	Decision - Grant/Part Grant/Refuse	Basis for refusal - Article of Regulation	Public Interest	Emissions - where information is refused under Article 8 and/or 9(1)(c)
1	20200113	20200113_Lett from P. Nugent Ast. Sec	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
2	20200124	20200124_P. Nugent Assistant Sec - IFI Role Business Case	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
3	20200124	20200124_ROLE BUSINESS CASE - As Approved	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
4	20200123	0.a COVER LETTER Board Meeting - January 30th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
5	20200123	0.b Agenda Brd Mtg - January 30th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
6	20200117	4.a 20200117_Letter to MOS_Board Chairman_Green Paper	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
7	20200122	4.b 20200122_Response to TAFI	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
8	20200123	5.b 2020 Budget Adjustments	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
9	20200123	5.b ii Redrafted Budget 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
10	20200123	5.c Re-drafted Projected Cashflow 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
11	20200123	7. Climate Mandate_Jan2020_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
12	20200123	8. CEO Report Jan 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
13	20200123	9 a ii Executive Summary of November 19_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
14	20200123	9. a ii Board accounts Nov'19_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
15	20200123	10. 20191122_(EMAIL & Phone) Mins of ARC Mtg_November 22nd 2019	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
16	20200123	12.a 2019 Communications Evaluation_Final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
17	20200123	12.b i Lough Ree - Commercial Licence Applications for 2020_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
18	20200123	12.b ii Lough Ree Commercial Draft Net Licence Regs	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
19	20200123	12.c Jan20_Licence Distributor Application_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
20	20200210	20200210_PROPOSED CONFERENCE CALL Thursday February 13th 2020 - 2.00pm	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
21	20200210	JOB SPEC Final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
22	20200210	Terms & Conditions - CEO Final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
23	20200220	0.a COVER LETTER Board Meeting - February 27th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
24	20200220	0.b Agenda Brd Mtg - February	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
25	20200220	4.a ACI Letter to IFI 06th Feb 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
26	20200220	4.b Submission - S. Coady	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
27	20200220	5.a Business Plan Report 2020_Jan V1.3	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
28	20200220	5.b Final Budget 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
29	20200220	5.c i National Fisheries Protection Plan 2020 - Draft 14.02.20_Edits	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
30	20200220	5.c ii National Fisheries Protection Plan Review 2019 17-02-20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
31	20200220	5.d i IFI Development 2020 planning & monitoring of progress Feb 2020 CB_Edits	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
32	20200220	5.d ii Development Monitoring Combined Q1 12.02.20_	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
33	20200220	6.a Fish Farm Business Case - Board Submission Feb 2020_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
34	20200220	6.b ABTG-IFI01~FinIRpt2nd~SGP~28-Oct-19	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
35	20200220	7.a CLIMATEMANDATE_Feb2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
36	20200220	8. CEO Report for Feb 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
37	20200220	9.a i Executive Summary of December 19 - mm - 04.02.20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
38	20200220	9.a ii Board accounts Dec'19	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
39	20200220	9.b Briefing Note History of Pay Funding Deficiency PDCB EDIT	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
40	20200220	9.c Briefing Note Pay Adjustment_Feb 2020_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
41	20200220	PSSA_1Mar2019	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
42	20200220	9.d Board Capital Expenditure Approval -2 PV Systems PD_Prep	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
43	20200220	9.d Capital Appraisal - Photovoltaic	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
44	20200220	9.e Supplementary Pension - Quarterly Report_from ARC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
45	20200220	10.a Mins of ARC Meeting - 13th February 2020_Apprvd by Email Feb 18th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
46	20200220	10.b i IFI Audit Cert 2018_C&AG	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
47	20200220	10.b ii IFI Management Letter 2018 CAG with Mgmt Responses PD_EF_ARC_C&AG	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
48	20200220	10.c i DCCAE Management Letter Item - Cover	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
49	20200220	10.c ii IFI Funding - DCCAE Management Letter (from C&AG)	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
50	20200220	10.c iii IFI Bank Balance_Funding Explained to DCCAE (to D. Maher)	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
51	20200220	10.c iv IFI Bank Balances 2016 - 2018 - 09.01.20 PD final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
52	20200220	10.d DRAFT - Review of Internal Communications Draft Report_from ARC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
53	20200220	10.e DRAFT - Review of Internal Financial Controls - Final_from ARC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
54	20200220	10.f DRAFT - Internal Audit Charter_from ARC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
55	20200220	11.a Risk register V10 12_BOARD Mtg_Jan '20 DRAFT	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
56	20200318	0. Agenda Brd Mtg - Mar 25th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
57	20200319	Narrative_v4	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
58	20200319	6.1 b Following ARC_IFI 2019 Financial Statements CAG Draft	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
59	20200318	6.1 DCCAE v C&AG Draft 2019_	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
60	20200318	6.1 IFI 2019 Financial Statements C&AG	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
61	20200318	6.2 a Executive Summary of February 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
62	20200318	6.2 b Board accounts Feb'20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
63	20200318	7.1 APPROVED Annual Report of the Audit Risk Committee 2019	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
64	20200318	7.2 Final Management Letter - OACG - audit of FS 2018	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
65	20200318	8.1 Risk register V10 12_BOARD Mtg_Jan '20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
66	20200409	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - April 16th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
67	20200409	0.2 DRAFT Agenda Brd Mtg - April 16th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
68	20200409	2.3 REPORT - IFI Board Mtg Feb 27th & March 25th_Approved	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
69	20200409	3.1 20200316_Letter from TAFI - M. Kinneavy Page 1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
70	20200409	3.1 20200316_Letter from TAFI - M. Kinneavy Page 2	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
71	20200409	3.2 Draft Response to TAFI Letter	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
72	20200409	4.1 Proposal - New ARC Member incl. Criteria for Selection of ARC Members	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

73	20200421	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - April 28th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
74	20200421	0.2 DRAFT Agenda Brd Mtg - April 28th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
75	20200421	4.1 Lett to M. Kineavy re Fish Farm Working Group	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
76	20200421	4.2 Board Member Submission HD Workshop - ML Heffernan	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
77	20200421	5.1 Organisational Structure Board Paper Final_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
78	20200421	6.1 Cimate Action Framework Update_Apr2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
79	20200421	7. CEO Report Apr 2020_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
80	20200421	8.1 DRAFT Annual Report 2019	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
81	20200421	8.2 a Executive Summary of March 2020 - 09.04.20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
82	20200421	8.2 b Board accounts Mar'20_Summary Variances	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
83	20200421	8.2 c Board accounts Mar'20_Mar Income & Expenditure	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
84	20200421	8.3 a Quarterly Executive Summary of Q1 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
85	20200421	8.3 b Q1 Jan - Mar'20 - Final PDF	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
86	20200421	8.4 Funding Call Outcome Report for 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
87	20200421	8.5 Erriff Building Briefing Note April 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
88	20200421	9.1 Approved_ Mins of ARC Meeting - 19th March 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
89	20200421	10.1 IFI Response to COVID-19_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
90	20200421	11.1 Protection Plan Report - March 2020_Apr Mtg_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
91	20200421	11.2 2020 Habitats and conservation Works Plan 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
92	20200421	11.3 IFI Angling Tourism Strategic Marketing Plan - Briefing Note April 2020_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
93	20200421	12.1 Commercial Salmon Licence Report 20-04-2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
94	20200421	12.2 Barrow Bye law 2019 - SERBD April 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
95	20200421	12.3 Bye law 961 Revocation -SWRBD April 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
96	20200421	12.4 Licence Distributor - SWRBD April 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
97	20200421	12.5 Records Management Policy_Draft for Approval	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
98	20200525	20200407_Email from D. Maher to Chair	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
99	20200525	20200525_Email from P. Nugent to Chair	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
100	20200610	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - June 18th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
101	20200610	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - June 18th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
102	20200610	2.1 DRAFT Board Meeting Minutes - April 28 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
103	20200610	4.1 a 20200603_IFI Corporate Plan_ Extension to Submission Deadline	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
104	20200610	4.1 b 20200609_June 2020 IFI Letter from Min Canney re CP Submission	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
105	20200610	4.2 Board Member Submission_Internal Audit	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
106	20200610	6.2 Climate Action Framework - Update_June2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
107	20200610	7.1 CEOs Report for June 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
108	20200610	8.1a Executive Summary of May 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
109	20200610	8.1b Board accounts May 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
110	20200610	8.2 Funding Call 2020 (Cap Grants) Add Info Costs	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
111	20200610	9.1 Mins of ARC Meeting - 14th May 2020_Reviewed by Chair	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
112	20200610	9.2 Review of IFI Board Sub-committees and Draft Protocol	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
113	20200610	10.1 Mins of SHR Comm Meeting - 15th May 2020_Reviewed by Chair	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
114	20200610	11.1 Risk register V10 13_ARC Mtg_May '20_EXEC + ARC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
115	20200610	11.3 DPO Report to the Board_June 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
116	20200610	12.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - May 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
117	20200610	12.2 Licence Price Proposal 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
118	20200610	12.3 Dormant Accounts Fund - Funding Application for 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
119	20200610	12.4 a Novice Anglers Strategy June 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
120	20200610	12.4 b Novice Anglers Strategy 2020-2025	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
121	20200610	13.1 Wild Salmon and Sea Trout Statistics Report 2019_For Note	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
122	20200610	13.2 a Control of Lagarosiphon major 2019 Report from WRBD_For Note	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
123	20200610	13.2 b IFI R&D Lagarosiphon_report_2018_2019 Final_For Note	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
124	20200623	0.0 DRAFT Agenda Brd Mtg - June 25th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
125	20200623	2.0 Motion Deputy CEO	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
126	20200623	3.0 Sponsorship Programme 2020 - Recommended Awards Summer 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
127	20200627	0.0 DRAFT Agenda Brd Mtg - June 29th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
128	20200627	1. Appointment of Deputy CEO	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
129	20200627	2. 29 June 2020 Ciaran	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
130	20200820	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - August 20th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
131	20200820	0.2 AGENDA Board Meeting - August 20th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
132	20200820	2.4 Board Meeting Report - June 18th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
133	20200820	4.1 20200717_Dormant Accounts fund lett_D. Maher	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
134	20200820	4.2 20200714_IFI-Dept Representatives Meeting Request_D. Maher	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
135	20200820	6. IFI Business Plan July 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
136	20200820	7. Climate Action Framework Update - August 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
137	20200820	8.1 Deputy CEO's Report	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
138	20200820	8.1.a 20200623_Letter Chef Aid Inver	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
139	20200820	8.1b 20200806_Letter Louth County Council	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
140	20200820	9.1a Executive Summary Board accounts June 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
141	20200820	9.1b Board accounts June 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
142	20200820	9.2a FSQ2 Executive Summary	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
143	20200820	9.2b FSQ2	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
144	20200820	9.3 Corporate Website Development Services - Capital Expenditure Appraisal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
145	20200820	9.4 Vehicles - Capital Expenditure Appraisal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
146	20200820	9.5 Thermal Imaging - Capital Investment Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
147	20200820	9.6 Drones Programme Training Update & Capital Investment Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
148	20200820	9.7 Ballynalty Stream Riparian Management Project - NSAD-20-237	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
149	20200820	9.8 20200730_IFI-Eels sanction_Lett D. Maher	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
150	20200820	9.9 Aasleagh Lodge Paper - August 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
151	20200820	10.1a Monthly Protection Plan Review - June Incl Q2 Metrics 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
152	20200820	10.1b Monthly Protection Plan Review - July 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
153	20200820	10.2 Conservation and Habitats Works Report - June 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

154	20200820	10.3 IFI Code of Business Conduct for Employees _Jul 2020_DRAFT Revised	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
155	20200820	11.1 Mins of SHR Comm Meeting - 16th June 2020_Aprvrd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
156	20200820	13.1 Covid 19 Impact on Operations & Finance	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
157	20200925	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - September 25th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
158	20200925	0.2 AGENDA Board Meeting - September 2020_Final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
159	20200925	2.2 Board Meeting Report - August 20th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
160	20200925	4.1.1 DCCAE - IFI Drawdown Payment Letter - Q3 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
161	20200925	4.1.2 DPER Circular re Grant Funding - 13 2014	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
162	20200925	5.1 IFI Heads - Corporate Plan 2016-2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
163	20200925	5.2 RBD Directors - Corporate Plan 2016 - 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
164	20200925	5.3 S. Boland Corp Plan Submission	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
165	20200925	Applied	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
166	20200925	6.1 DRAFT Oversight Agreement as at Sept 10th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
167	20200925	6.2 DRAFT Performance Delivery Agreement as at Sept 10th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
168	20200925	6.2.2 DRAFT_PDA Metrics 2020-2022_Long List	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
169	20200925	8.1 CLIMATE MANDATE_September 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
170	20200925	10.1.1 Executive Summary of August 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
171	20200925	10.1.2 Management Accounts August 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
172	20200925	10.2 Corporate Website Development Services - Capital Exp Appraisal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
173	20200925	10.2 Corporate Website Development Services - Capital Expenditure Appraisal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
174	20200925	10.3 Vehicles Capital Exp Appraisal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
175	20200925	10.3.1 Vehicle Statistics	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
176	20200925	10.4 Thermal Imaging Devices - Capital Investment Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
177	20200925	10.5 Drones Programme Training Update & Capital Investment Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
178	20200925	10.6 Ballynalty Stream Riparian Management Project - NSAD-20-237	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
179	20200925	10.6.1 Ballynalty Stream Riparian Management Project - NSAD-20-237	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
180	20200925	10.6.2 Ballynalty Board Members' Site Visit Report 14th September 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
181	20200925	10.7.1 Proposed Dormant Account Disbursement Scheme - Angling for All	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
182	20200925	10.7.2 Angling for All - Appendix I - Funding Call Guidelines DRAFT	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
183	20200925	11.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review for August 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
184	20200925	11.2.1 20200914 Conservation and Habitats July 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
185	20200925	11.2.2 20200914 Report Other categories to July 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
186	20200925	12.1 DRAFT Mins of ARC Meeting - 9th September 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
187	20200925	12.2 2020 IFI Internal Audit Review of Health and Safety_Final 14.09.20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
188	20200925	12.3 DRAFT Reviewed Gifts and Hospitality Policy & Procedure V4.0 - August 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
189	20200925	12.4 DRAFT Reviewed Protected Disclosures Policy Procedure V3.1 - August 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
190	20200925	12.5 DRAFT Conflict of Interest Policy & Procedure V0.2_NEW_Following ARC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
191	20200925	13.1 DRAFT Terms of Reference Property Subcommittee	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
192	20200925	14.1.1 IFI Covid-19 Risk Assessment Vehicle Dual Occupancy	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
193	20200925	14.1.2 IFI Covid-19 Vehicle Dual Occupancy FAQ	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
194	20200925	14.2 Risk register V10 13_Board Mtg_June 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
195	20200925	15.1 Draft 2021 Board Meeting Dates	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
196	20201112	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - November 12th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
197	20201112	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - November 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
198	20201112	2.2 BOARD MEETING REPORT - September 25th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
199	20201112	4.1.1 Correspondence_20201021_TAFI	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
200	20201112	Ryan	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
201	20201112	5.1 IFI Approach to Development of Corporate Plan 2021-2026 v1.3	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
202	20201112	5.2 IFI Corporate Plan Development - Board Update 12.11..20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
203	20201112	6.1 CLIMATEMANDATE_October2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
204	20201112	7.1 Deputy CEO Report - Board November 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
205	20201112	8.1.1 Executive Summary of Management Accs September 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
206	20201112	8.1.2 Management Accounts Sept '20 Q3	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
207	20201112	8.2.1 Executive Summary of Financial Accounts Q3 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
208	20201112	8.2.2 Financial Accounts Sept '20 Q3	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
209	20201112	8.3 Vehicles Review	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
210	20201112	8.4 Options for Procurement of Plant & Machinery	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
211	20201112	8.5 Additional Vehicles Purchase Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
212	20201112	9.1 Protection Plan Review - September 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
213	20201112	9.2 Report Conservation and Habitats Report - September 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
214	20201112	9.3 Other Works & Categories Report - September 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
215	20201112	9.4 Habitats & Conservation Projects - 2021 Funding	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
216	20201112	9.5.1 ORIS 2020 funding application Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
217	20201112	9.5.2 2020 ORIS Scheme Outline	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
218	20201112	10.2 Western River Basin District Business case x 2_RB	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
219	20201112	10.3 Outstanding Commitment Awards	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
220	20201112	11.2.1 Proposed New Pedestrian Bridge - Galway City Briefing Note	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
221	20201112	11.2.2 Map of Location of Pedestrian Bridge Galway	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
222	20201112	11.3 Cornamona Base - Briefing Note re Option to Purchase	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
223	20201112	12.1 Risk register V10 13_Board Mtg_June '20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
224	20201112	13.1 Board Meeting Dates - 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
225	20201112	13.1.1 Conflict of Interest Policy & Procedure V0.2_Aproved Sept 25th '20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
226	20201112	13.2.1 B08 IFI Code of Business Conduct for Directors_APPRVD MAR 18_Updtd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
227	20201119	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - November 19th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
228	20201119	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - November 19th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
229	20201119	1.1.1 Board Submission - November 2020 - Fish Farm	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
230	20201119	1.1.2 Fish Farm Chemical use and Customer list_price_deliveries 2017 to 2019	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
231	20201119	1.1.3 IFI Fish Farm- Activities - Board Briefing Note_December 2019	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
232	20201119	1.1.4 2016_01_IFI Fish Farm Review Board Paper Jan 2015 16_1_16	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
233	20201119	1.2 Letter to Cathal Gallagher IFI - Roscrea Fish Farm_19.08.2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
234	20201119	1.3.1 2019 ABTG-Support services to design new FF ~FinIRpt~SGP~28-Oct-19	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

235	20201119	1.3.2 2019 ABTG_IFI01-BoQ-SGP Cost Est Oct-19	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
236	20201119	1.4 2016_10 IFI Fish Farms Environmental Survey Report - KD Environmental	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
237	20201119	1.5 2015_05 Expert Analysis to Support Optimised Production of Trout (CAS Inc)	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
238	20201217	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - December 17th 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
239	20201217	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - December 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
240	20201217	4.1.1 Letter - Annex to the Code of Practice	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
241	20201217	4.1.2 2020_0918 Circular 14-2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
242	20201217	4.1.3 2020_0918 Annex to the Code of Practice for the Governance of State Bodies	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
243	20201217	6.1 IFI Feasibility Review Freshwater Aquaculture 2_12_20 final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
244	20201217	7.1 Climate Mandate_November 2020 - Update	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
245	20201217	9.1.1 Letter of Representation from IFI regarding the Financial Statements 2019	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
246	20201217	9.1.2 IFI 2019 FS Governance & Internal Control Statement	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
247	20201217	9.1.3 IFI 2019 Financial Statements Audited & Approved by C&AG	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
248	20201217	9.2.1 IFI Income & Expenditure Budget 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
249	20201217	9.2.2 IFI Capital Budget 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
250	20201217	9.2.3 Cashflow December - 10.12.20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
251	20201217	9.3 Striking of the Fishery Rate 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
252	20201217	9.4 IFI Sponsorship Programme 2021 - Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
253	20201217	9.5 IFI State Fishery Permit Prices 2021 - Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
254	20201217	10.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review to November 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
255	20201217	10.2 IFI RIB Fleet Report - December 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
256	20201217	10.3 Draft Reviewed IFI Fleet Procedure	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
257	20201217	10.4 Lett to IFI (EFortune) re 2019 verification of Compliance CoPGSB	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
258	20201217	10.5 B14 Training Application for Board members 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
259	20201217	11.1 Mins of ARC Meeting November 23rd 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
260	20201217	11.1.2 Internal Audit Review - Previous Audit Recommendations	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
261	20201217	11.2 Internal Audit Review of Internal Financial Controls 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
262	20201217	11.3 Internal Audit Review of IT Strategy Security and Resilience 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
263	20201217	11.4 Internal Audit Follow up Review of Previous Audit Recommendations	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
264	20201217	12.1 Mins of SHR Comm Meeting - 4th November 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
265	20201217	13.1 Mins of Property Sub-comm Meeting December 1st 2020_Chr Feedback	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
266	20201217	13.2 Aasleagh Lodge - Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
267	20201217	14.1 Risk register V10 14_Board Mtg_Nov '20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
268	20201217	Board Schedule_2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
269	20200124	20200124_Board (Con Call) minutes_Jan 24th_review by Chair_APPRVD Feb 27th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
270	20200130	20200130_Minutes Board Meeting - January 30th_review by Chair_APPRVD Feb 27th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
271	20200213	25th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
272	20200325	20200325_Minutes Board Meeting - March 25th_Chr_Apr 16th Meeting	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
273	20200416	20200416_Minutes Board Meeting - April 16th_Chr_FINAL_APPRVD Apr 28th Meeting	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
274	20200428	20200428_Minutes Board Meeting - April 28th_Chair_FINAL_APPRVD June 18th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
275	20200527	20200527_Minutes Board Meeting - May 27th_Chair_APPRVD June 18th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
276	20200618	20200618_Minutes Board Meeting- June 18th_Chair_Feedback_APPRVD Aug 20th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
277	20200625	20200625_Minutes Board Meeting - June 25th 2020_Chair_Feedback_APPRVD Aug 20th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
278	20200629	20200629_Minutes Board Meeting - June 29th 2020_Chair_APPRVD Aug 20th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
279	20200820	20200820_Minutes Board Meeting - August 20th 2020_Chair_Feedback_APPRVD Sept 25th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
280	20200921	20200921_Minutes Board Meeting - September 21st 2020_APPRVD Sept 25th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
281	20200925	20200925_Minutes Board Meeting - September 25th_APPRVD Nov 12th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
282	20201112	20201112_Minutes Board Meeting - November 12th_review by Chair_APPRVD Dec 17th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
283	20201119	20201119_Minutes Board Meeting - November 19th_review by Chr_CG_APPRVD Dec 17th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
284	20201217	20201217_Minutes Board Meeting - December 17th_Apprvd Jan 27th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
285	20210127	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - January 27th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
286	20210127	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - January 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
287	20210127	2.3 December Board Meeting Report	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
288	20210127	4.1.1a 20201221_P. Boyle Donegal Angling Tourism Alliance	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
289	20210127	4.1.1b 20201221_Donegal Game Fishery Catchment Map	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
290	20210127	4.1.2 Conservation & Development Plan Donegal Fisheries Pilot Jan 21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
291	20210127	7.1.1 Business Plan 2020 Dashboard Report	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
292	20210127	7.1.2 Business Plan Detailed Report 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
293	20210127	8.1 Climate Mandate Dec 20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
294	20210127	9.1 CEO Report Jan 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
295	20210127	10.1.1 Management Accounts Nov 20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
296	20210127	10.1.2 Executive Summary - Mgmt Acnts Nov 20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
297	20210127	10.2.1 Draft Budget 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
298	20210127	10.2.2 Draft Budget 2021 - Considerations	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
299	20210127	11.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review Dec 20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
300	20210127	11.2 Conservation and Habitats Dec 20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
301	20210127	11.3 Other categories Jan 21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
302	20210127	11.4 ESRI 2021 - Jan 21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
303	20210127	11.5 DRAFT Stock Management Plan - Jan 21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
304	20210127	11.6 DRAFT IFI Fleet Policy Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
305	20210127	11.7 River Restoration Guidance_IFI Summary-One pager 20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
306	20210127	13.2 Aasleagh Lodge - Feasibility Study Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
307	20210127	14.1 COVID-19 Actions, Mitigations and Controls Jan 21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
308	20210127	14.2 Risk register V10 14_Board Mtg_Nov 20	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
309	20210216	2.1 IFI Board WFD Overview 10_2_21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
310	20210216	3.1 HLOs Consolidated Updated 10-02-21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
311	20210216	2020 Communications Evaluation final - Sent to Board by email	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

312	20210301	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 24 February 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
313	20210301	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - 1st March 2021_UPDATED	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
314	20210301	2.3 Board Meeting Report - January 27th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
315	20210301	4.1.1 20210208_Lett to Chair L Carra Catchment Association	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
316	20210301	4.1.2 20210215_Lett from Chair L. Carra Catchment Association	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
317	20210301	6.1 CLIMATE MANDATE_January2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
318	20210301	7.1 CEOs Report Feb 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
319	20210301	8.1.1 Mgmt Accounts Dec '20 - Executive Summary_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
320	20210301	8.1.2 Mgmt Accounts Dec'20_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
321	20210301	8.2 DRAFT BUDGET 2021- FINAL - 03.02.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
322	20210301	8.2.2 OPs Development Budget and resources summary doc 2021 02 23_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
323	20210301	8.3 Seasonal Officer Recruitment Feb 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
324	20210301	8.4 Briefing Note on IFI Workwear Feb 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
325	20210301	8.5 Assessment of Donegal Angling Tourism Alliance Funding Request	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
326	20210301	8.6 Weed Management L. Corrib_Contract Costs_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
327	20210301	8.7.1 Board Capital Expenditure Appraisal_Riparian works_Arney River	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
328	20210301	8.7.2 Board Capital Expenditure Appraisal_RooRiver	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
329	20210301	8.8 L Ree Commercial Trout Draft Net Licences 2021 - Feb 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
330	20210301	8.9 Notification - Appointment of IFI's Legal Service Providers	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
331	20210301	8.10 Bank mandate	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
332	20210301	10.1 ARC Meeting Minutes - 10th February 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
333	20210301	10.2 DRAFT Internal Audit Plan 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
334	20210301	10.3 Annual Report of the Audit Risk Committee 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
335	20210301	11.1 Property Sub-comm Meeting Minutes - 25th January 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
336	20210301	11.2 Property Sub-comm Meeting Minutes - 8th February 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
337	20210301	12.1 SHR Sub-comm Meeting Minutes - 20th January 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
338	20210301	13.1 Risk register V10 16_Board Mtg_Feb '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
339	20210325	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 25 March 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
340	20210325	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - 25 March 2021_Final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
341	20210325	2.3 Board Meeting Report - February 16th & March 1st	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
342	20210325	4.1 SSTRAI Letter_Chair	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
343	20210325	4.2.1 IFI to GCC - Withdrawal of Obj Bridge at Salmon Weir 20210310	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
344	20210325	4.2.2 GCC to IFI - Acknowledgement of Ltt re withdrawal 20210311	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
345	20210325	4.3 Board Member Submission on Lagarosiphon major	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
346	20210325	5.1 Fish Farm Update 12.03.2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
347	20210325	6.1 Climate Mandate_Feb_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
348	20210325	7.1 CEO Report March 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
349	20210325	8.1.1 IFI 2020 Financial Statements CAG Draft	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
350	20210325	8.1.2 IFI Gov and Int Control Statement CAG Draft - IFD11Mar_EF15Mar_PD16Mar	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
351	20210325	9.1 Owenriff Rehabilitation Plan 2018_Board update March 2021_final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
352	20210325	9.2 National Fisheries Protection Plan 2021 - Version 1_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
353	20210325	10.2 VFM Patrols Report_20210302	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
354	20210325	10.3.1 Audit Risk Committee Terms of Ref Updtd_Mar '21_Draft for Approval	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
355	20210325	10.3.2 IFI Standing Orders - March 2021_Draft for Approval	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
356	20210325	11.1 Habitats and Conservation Funding for 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
357	20210325	11.2.1 Proposed Byelaw to protect habitat in Blacksod & Clew Bay_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
358	20210325	11.2.2 Proposed National Byelaw Arctic char_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
359	20210325	11.2.3 Proposed Byelaws L. Lene_GrandCanalEdenderry_Malahide_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
360	20210325	11.2.4 Progressed Bye Law Fisheries Env and Habitats Protection - Transfer Prohibition	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
361	20210325	12.1 Risk register V10 18_Board Mtg_Mar '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
362	20210325	202102&03_Febuary & March (1st) Board Meeting Report	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
363	20210426	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 26 April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
364	20210426	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - 26 April 2021_DRAFT	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
365	20210426	2.1.1 IFI Corporate Plan V0.7	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
366	20210426	2.1.2 IFI Approach to Development of Corporate Plan 2021-2025	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
367	20210426	3.1 2020 Board Evaluation - DRAFT FOR BOARD 120421	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
368	20210426	3.1.1 2020 IFI External Board Evaluation Report and Recommendations	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
369	20210426	3.1.2 2020 Board Evaluation - Recommendations v0.1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
370	20210426	3.2 IFI Evaluation draft report summary 260421	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
371	20210430	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 30 April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
372	20210430	0.2 Agenda Brd Meeting - 30 April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
373	20210430	2.3 Board Meeting Report - March 25th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
374	20210430	4.1.1 Letter from CEO to FISSTA re Evaluation Panel 08.04.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
375	20210430	4.1.2 Letter from CEO to SSTRAI re Evaluation Panel 08.04.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
376	20210430	4.2.1 Letter CEO to OPW re meeting 14.04.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
377	20210430	4.3.1.1 Letter to Chair from NARA re NIFF 21.04.15	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
378	20210430	4.3.1.2 Letter to Chair from NARA re NIFF 21.04.15 - To Minister	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
379	20210430	4.3.2 Letter to Chair from TAFI re NIFF 21.04.15	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
380	20210430	4.3.3 Letter to Chair from Garrykennedy Fishing Club re NIFF 21.04.15	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
381	20210430	4.4.1 Letter from Sec to Donegal Angling Tourism Alliance 21.04.09	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
382	20210430	4.5.1 Board Submission_Annacotty Weir	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
383	20210430	6.1 CLIMATE MANDATE March2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
384	20210430	8.1 CEO Report April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
385	20210430	9.1.1 Executive Summary Management Accounts March 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
386	20210430	9.1.2 Board Management Accounts March 21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
387	20210430	9.2.1 Quarterly Accounts Executive Summary Q1 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
388	20210430	9.2.2 Q1 Jan - Mar 2021 Quarterly Accounts	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
389	20210430	9.3 Draft Capital Budget 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A



390	20210430	9.4 Board Capital Expenditure Appraisal - Boat Shed Aasleagh	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
391	20210430	9.5 Estimated Vehicle Hire Costs April 2021 Final 21_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
392	20210430	9.6 DRAFT Chairman's Comprehensive Report to the Minister - 2020_DECC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
393	20210430	9.7 DRAFT Annual Report 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
394	20210430	9.8 Final C&AG 2019 Audit - Management Letter - Management Responses	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
395	20210430	10.1.1 Mins of ARC Meeting March 11th 2021_ Approved	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
396	20210430	11.1 Mins of Property Sub-comm Meeting April 20th 2021_ Approved by Email	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
397	20210430	12.1 Management responses to the conclusions IA Review of VFM of Fisheries Patrols	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
398	20210430	12.2 Protection Plan 2021 - Additional Development Hours	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
399	20210430	12.3 Commercial Salmon Licence Applications 2021 Report	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
400	20210430	12.4 Update Paper on Lagarosiphon Contract	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
401	20210430	12.5.1 Procedure for Private Water Keepers Applications	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
402	20210430	12.5.2 Certificate of Suitability for appointment as a Private Water Keeper	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
403	20210430	12.6 Farming and Community Biodiversity Initiative Funding Application	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
404	20210430	13.1 NSAD Project Queries April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
405	20210430	13.2 IFI Non-contractor Habitats Project Listing	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
406	20210430	13.3 Monthly Protection Plan Review March 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
407	20210430	13.4.1 Conservation and Habitats March 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
408	20210430	13.4.2 Other categories Report March 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
409	20210430	14.1 Risk register V10 18_ Board Mtg_ Mar '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
410	20210430	16. Response to European Parliment Petition 21.04.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
411	20210526	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 26 May 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
412	20210526	0.2 Agenda Brd Mtg - 26 May 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
413	20210526	2.3 Board Meeting Report - April 26th & April 30th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
414	20210526	4.1 Ballinlough Development Association - Lett to T Doherty	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
415	20210526	5.1 Joint Fish Farm Working Group_TOR_ Under review	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
416	20210526	6.1 IFI's Climate Mandate Report_April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
417	20210526	7.1 CEO Report May 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
418	20210526	8.1 2021 Overall Action List Final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
419	20210526	10.1.1 Management Accounts - Executive Summary April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
420	20210526	10.1.2 Management Accounts April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
421	20210526	10.2 1854431 Arney River Phase 2 - IVA50584- Riparian works along the bank of the Arney River (2) - form	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
422	20210526	10.2.1 Board Capital Expenditure Appraisal_Riparian works_Arney River_Phase2	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
423	20210526	11.1 Mins of ARC Meeting April 20th 2021_ Approved by Email	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
424	20210526	12.1 Property Sub-committee ToR V1.0	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
425	20210526	13.1 Habitats and Conservation Funding Call Outcome - 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
426	20210526	13.2 Corrib Catchment River Habitat Enhancement Prioritisation	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
427	20210526	14.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - April 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
428	20210526	14.2 Windfarms Cheat Sheet_May2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
429	20210526	15.1 Risk register V10 18_ Board Mtg_ Mar '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
430	20210630	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 30 June 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
431	20210630	0.2 NEW FORMAT AGENDA - 30 June 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
432	20210630	2.1.3 Board Meetings Actns Arising_May 2021_at June 22nd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
433	20210630	2.2.1 Letter from CEO to NCCFI 26.05.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
434	20210630	2.2.2 Letter from FISSTA to CEO 15.04.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
435	20210630	2.2.3 Letter from SSTRAI to CEO 06.06.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
436	20210630	2.2.4 Letter from CEO to John Hegarty 16.06.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
437	20210630	2.3 Board Meeting Report - May 26th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
438	20210630	2.3.1 Climate Action Update_June 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
439	20210630	2.3.2 Proposed Salmon & Sea Trout Licence Prices 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
440	20210630	3.1 CEO Report June 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
441	20210630	4.1.1 Executive Summary of May 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
442	20210630	4.1.2 Board accounts May'21_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
443	20210630	4.2.1 Electric Vehicle Procurement_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
444	20210630	6.1 2021 Overall Action List Final (Business Plan)	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
445	20210630	6.2 Roscrea Fish Farm The Future of IFI Freshwater Aquaculture_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
446	20210630	6.3 Draft NIFF Terms of Reference_2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
447	20210630	7.1 Risk register V10 19_ Board Mtg_June '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
448	20210630	9.1 Mins of ARC Meeting June 9th 2021_Draft	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
449	20210630	10.1 Designation of the Great Western Lakes as managed wild brown trout fisheries_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
450	20210630	10.2 Proposal to procure Funding Optimisation Consultancy_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
451	20210630	10.3 Habitats and Conservation Funding for 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
452	20210630	10.4 ORIS 2021 funding application_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
453	20210630	10.5 Ballynalty Update NSADF 20 237_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
454	20210630	10.6 Hollygrove Lake Access June 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
455	20210630	10.7 Proposed Access Projects_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
456	20210630	11.1.1 Dormant Accounts funded activities 2019-2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
457	20210630	11.1.2 Dormant Accounts funds reconciliation 2019 +2020_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
458	20210630	11.1.3 Dormant Accounts funded - Angling for All Audit Report_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
459	20210630	11.2 Draft Angling for All Scheme Guidelines 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
460	20210630	11.3 Draft Novice Angler Strategy_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
461	20210630	11.4 Dormant Accounts Fund 2022 Application Proposal June 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
462	20210630	14.1 Summary of Project Outcomes Rev 3_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
463	20210630	14.2.1 Report re Development works in Shannon_2021 Summary - Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

464	20210630	14.2.2 Report re Development works in Shannon_Detailed - Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
465	20210630	14.3 Monthly Protection Plan Review - May 2021 - Board Submission	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
466	20210630	14.4 IFISH River Restoration Guidance in an era of Climate Change	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
467	20210720	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 20 July 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
468	20210720	0.2 AGENDA - 20 July 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
469	20210720	2.1 IFI Advices re Novice Angler Activation Programme 13-07-2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
470	20210720	3.1.1 Dormant Accounts funded activities 2019-2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
471	20210720	3.1.2 Dormant Accounts funds reconciliation 2019 +2020_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
472	20210720	3.1.3 Dormant Accounts funded - Angling for All Audit Report_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
473	20210720	3.2 Draft Angling for All Scheme Guidelines 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
474	20210720	3.3 Draft Novice Angler Strategy_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
475	20210720	3.4 Dormant Accounts Fund 2022 Application Proposal June 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
476	20210720	4.1 Board Submission Sponsorship 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
477	20210720	5.1 AOB 1 - Draft Net Licences 2021 Letterkenny District	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
478	20210720	5.2 AOB 2 - Increase ORIS Funding Application	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
479	20210916	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 16 September 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
480	20210916	0.2 NEW FORMAT AGENDA	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
481	20210916	2.1.3 Board Meeting Report - June 30th 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
482	20210916	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_July 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
483	20210916	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_July 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
484	20210916	(Redacted)	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
485	20210916	2.3.2 DECC (D. Maher) to CEO - IFI Cash on Hand Issue - September 1st, 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
486	20210916	2.3.3 STAKEHOLDERS (L Ree Access for All) to CEO- Education & Outreach Programme_August 12th, 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
487	20210916	2.3.4a SIPTU (G. Harris) to Board - Education & Outreach Programme_August 17th, 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
488	20210916	2.3.4b SIPTU (G. Harris) to Board - Humans Rights September 6th, 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
489	20210916	2.3.5 STAKEHOLDER (C. O'Kelly, Kells Tackle ) to CEO - Dodder Works_August 8th, 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
490	20210916	2.3.6 River Dodder Flood Alleviation Scheme Update_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
491	20210916	2.3.7 CLIMATE MANDATE_JunetoAug 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
492	20210916	2.3.8 Quarterly Board Report Conservation and Habitats June 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
493	20210916	2.3.9 Quarterly Board Report Other categories June 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
494	20210916	2.3.10 Monthly Protection Plan Review - June - July 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
495	20210916	2.3.11 Mobile Support Unit June-July 2021 Protection Review_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
496	20210916	3.0 CEO Summary Presentation Sept 2021 14.09.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
497	20210916	3.1 CEO's Report Sept 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
498	20210916	4.1.1 Executive Summary of June 2021 pd_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
499	20210916	4.1.2 Board accounts June'21 pd_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
500	20210916	4.1.3 Executive Summary of July 2021 Pd_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
501	20210916	4.1.4 Board accounts July'21 Pd_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
502	20210916	4.1.5 Vehicle Hire Costs Paper July 2021 FD_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
503	20210916	4.2.1 Quarterly Executive Summary of Q2 2021 PD align_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
504	20210916	4.2.2 Q2 Jan - June 2021 Accounts PD align_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
505	20210916	4.3.1 Pay underfunding gap updated to 2021_PD	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
506	20210916	6.2 2021 Bus Plan Overall Q2 - Update	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
507	20210916	6.3 IFI Fish Farm Rationale and Time Scale 2_9_21_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
508	20210916	7.1 Risk register V10 20_Board Mtg_August '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
509	20210916	8.0 CEO Strategic update Sept 2021 14.09.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
510	20210916	9.1 Mins of ARC Meeting July 20th 2021_Feedback Applied	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
511	20210916	10.1.1 Clarifications on Habitats and Conservation Funding 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
512	20210916	10.1.2 Board Member Submission on SCF21-123 (003)	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
513	20210916	10.1.3 Ballynahinch Fishery Co-Operative 19.08.2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
514	20210916	10.2 Business Case - SUA (Drones) Purchase Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
515	20210916	10.3.1 Epworth House Roof works, Clonmel Base_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
516	20210916	10.3.2 Epworth House_Tender Report_August 31st, 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
517	20210916	10.4 Note to Board on Legal Advice regarding Shot Head Salmon Licence	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
518	20210916	10.4.2 IFI note on ALAB determination of Shot Head appeal Technical advisors review 30.7.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
519	20210916	10.4.3 IFI Advices re ALAB decision re Shot Head	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
520	20210916	14.1 Wild Salmon & Sea Trout Statistics Report 2020_FOR INFORMATION	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
521	20210916	14.2 IFI Lagarosiphon Research L. Corrib (LARC) 2018 2020 Final Report August 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
522	20211020	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 20 October 2021_Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
523	20211020	0.2 AGENDA - 20 October 2021_Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
524	20211020	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meeting Report - July 20th & September 16th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
525	20211020	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_September 16th 2021_as at Oct 12th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
526	20211020	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_Sept 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
527	20211020	2.3 Board Meeting Report - July 20th & Sept 16th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
528	20211020	2.3.1 Climate Mandate Report_Sept2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
529	20211020	3.1 CEO Report Oct 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
530	20211020	4.1.1 Executive Summary - Management Accounts - August 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
531	20211020	4.1.2 Management Accounts - August 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
532	20211020	4.2 Revised Capital Expenditure Request - Vehicle Purchase_PV	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
533	20211020	4.3 Briefing Note - L.major Removal Contract_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
534	20211020	6.1 Risk register V10 21_September '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

535	20211020	8.1 Mins of ARC Meeting October 6th 2021_DRAFT_Members Feedback Applied	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
536	20211020	8.1.2 2021 IFI Energy Usage - final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
537	20211020	8.2 Property Sub-comm Meeting Minutes - 22nd September 2021_Draft	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
538	20211020	Applied	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
539	20211020	9.1 Habitats and conservation projects - 2022 Funding_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
540	20211020	9.2 Proposed changes to NSAD funded Projects_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
541	20211020	9.3 ESRI IFI Board Paper October 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
542	20211020	9.4 Proposed Access Project - Clonmacken Lake ShRBD_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
543	20211020	9.5 Balynahinch Presentation October 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
544	20211020	9.6 Clarification Request Development Projects_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
545	20211020	10.1 Board Report Conservation and Habitats October 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
546	20211020	10.2 Board Report Other Categories October 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
547	20211020	10.3 Monthly Protection Plan Review - August 2021_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
548	20211020	10.4 Mobile Support Unit_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
549	20211020	10.5.1 IFI Applied Research Board Overview final 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
550	20211020	10.5.2 IFI Applied Research Overview InfoGraphic 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
551	20211020	10.6 IFI Brown Trout_Research strategy 2021 to 2025	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
552	20211020	10.7 Design Guidance for Fish Passage on Small Barriers_August 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
553	20211118	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 18 November 2021 DRAFT	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
554	20211118	0.2 AGENDA_November 2021 Update	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
555	20211118	2.1.2 Board Meeting Report - October 20th 2021_Approved	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
556	20211118	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_October 20th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
557	20211118	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_October 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
558	20211118	2.3.1 Correspondence to Board - Ahare River & Biodiversity Group - 18 October 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
559	20211118	2.3.2 Correspondence to Board - Youth Action Ballina - 15 October 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
560	20211118	2.3.3 2020 IFI Board Evaluation - Recommendations - 9th November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
561	20211118	2.3.4 IFI Climate Action Mandate - October 2021 - AJ Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
562	20211118	3.1 CEO's Report - November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
563	20211118	3.1.1 CEO Strategic update Nov 2021 18.11.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
564	20211118	4.1.1 Executive Summary - Management Accounts - September 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
565	20211118	4.1.2 Management Accounts - September 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
566	20211118	4.2.1 Quarterly Exectuive Summary of Q3 Accounts 2021 - AJ Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
567	20211118	4.2.2 Quarterly Financial Statements Q3 2021 Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
568	20211118	5.1 2021 Business Plan Q3 update 2021_SMT Input	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
569	20211118	5.2 Review of ICT Function - Clarion Consulting - September 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
570	20211118	6.1 Risk register V10 21_November '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
571	20211118	7.1 Western Lakes Management Plan - AJ Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
572	20211118	8.1.1 Minutes of ARC Meeting November 4th 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
573	20211118	8.1.2 Outline of Review of Angling For All Grants	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
574	20211118	9.1 Proposed Access Project - Clonmacken Lake Slipway Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
575	20211118	9.2 2021 Sponsorship Updates 2021- 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
576	20211118	9.3 Permit Price Recommendations 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
577	20211118	9.4 Updated Owenmore Fishery Application	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
578	20211118	10.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review -September 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
579	20211118	10.2 Protection Review of the Mobile Support Unit September 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
580	20211118	11.1 DRAFT - Board Meeting Schedule_2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
581	20211118	13.1 Avicenne Study - Total Cost of Ownership EU & UK Electric Vehicles	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
582	20211216	0.1 Cover Letter - Board Meeting - 16 December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
583	20211216	0.2 Updated_Agenda_16 December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
584	20211216	2.2 Board Meetings Actions Arising - November 18th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
585	20211216	2.2.1 Board Meetings Resolutions - November 18th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
586	20211216	2.3.1 Climate Action Mandate - Novemeber 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
587	20211216	2.3.2 Windfarms in Fisheries Sensitive Catchments Combined Report	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
588	20211216	2.3.3 Correspondence from Donegal Co Co Re Char Byelaw proposal - 3 Decemeber 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
589	20211216	2.3.4 Connacht Tribune Article - 05th December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
590	20211216	3.1 CEO Report - December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
591	20211216	4.1.1 Executive Summary - Management Accounts - October 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
592	20211216	4.1.2 Management Accounts - October 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
593	20211216	4.2 Supplementary Pension Quarterly Report	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
594	20211216	4.3.1 Letter of advice Byrne Wallace to IFI on Pay relativity 23 November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
595	20211216	4.4 Striking of Fishery Rates for 2022 - November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
596	20211216	4.5 Justification for Capital Expenditure ICPMS - November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
597	20211216	4.6 Report on Insurance Cover in relation to RTI - December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
598	20211216	4.7 Trailer Repair Paper December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
599	20211216	4.8 IFI 2020 Financial Statements- 08th December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
600	20211216	4.8.1 IFI 2020 Letter of Representation - 08 December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
601	20211216	4.8.2 IFI Government and Internal Control Statement - 08 December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
602	20211216	5.2 IFI Letter of Support (Erriff Fishery) - 29 December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
603	20211216	6.1 Risk register V10 - 21 November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
604	20211216	6.2 Risk Management Policy_V 3.2_June '21_Feedback Applied	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
605	20211216	9.1 Organisational Restructure and Workforce Plan - November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
606	20211216	9.2 DRAFT Review of IFI Board Governance Policies	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
607	20211216	9.3 DRAFT Board Expenses Policy and Procedure	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
608	20211216	10.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review – October 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
609	20211216	10.2 Upper River Suck Development Plan - December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
610	20211216	11.1 Report on Insurance Cover in relation to RTI - December 2021, ARC Submission	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A



611	20211216	11.2 Options for the future of Aasleagh Lodge and Cottages	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
612	20211216	11.3 Recruitment Business Case in relation to Seasonal Recruitment Numbers 2022 - December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
613	20211216	11.4 Update on Judicial Review - December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
614	20210127	20210127_Board Meeting Minutes - January 27th_APPRVD Mar 1st	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
615	20210216	20210216_Board Meeting Minutes - February 16th_APPRVD Mar 25th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
616	20210301	20210301_Board Meeting Minutes - March 1st_AMNDD_APPRVD Mar 25th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
617	20210325	20210325_Board Meeting Minutes - March 25th_APPRVD Apr 30th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
618	20210426	20210426_Board Meeting Minutes - April 26th_APPRVD May 26th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
619	20210430	20210430_Board Meeting Minutes - April 30th_AMNDD_APPRVD May 25th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
620	20210526	20210526_Board Meeting Minutes - May 26th_AMNDD_APPRVD June 30th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
621	20210526	20210630_Board Meeting Minutes - June 30th_AMNDD_APPRVD Sept 16th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
622	20210720	20210720_Board Meeting Minutes - July 20th_APPRVD SEPT 16th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
623	20210916	20210916_Board Meeting Minutes - September 16th_APPRVD Oct 20th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
624	20211020	20211020_Board Meeting Minutes - October 20th_AMNDD_APPRVD Nov 18th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
625	20211118	20211118_Board Meeting Minutes - November 18th_AMNDD_APPRVD Dec 16th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
626	20211216	20211216_Board Meeting Minutes - December 16th_AMNDD APPROVED Jan 26th 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
627	20220126	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 26 January 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
628	20220126	0.2 AGENDA_26 January 2022_Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
629	20220126	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meetings Report - November & December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
630	20220126	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
631	20220126	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
632	20220126	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
633	20220126	2.3.1 Correspondence_Westmeath Co Co - 23122021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
634	20220126	2.3.2 Correspondence_211220_2022 IFI_DECC_Letter of Allocation	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
635	20220126	2.3.3 Correspondence_Letter from Donegal Co Co re Arctic char 07122021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
636	20220126	2.3.4 Correspondence_Letter to Donegal Co Co re Artic Char 14012022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
637	20220126	2.3.5 CLIMATEMANDATE_December2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
638	20220126	2.3.5 IFI Green Team Initiatives - Shannon RBD	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
639	20220126	3.1 CEO Report Jan 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
640	20220126	4.1.1 Executive Summary of November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
641	20220126	4.1.2 Board accounts November 081221 no 2 - Final Version 221221	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
642	20220126	5.1 Uninsured Vehicles Queries Raised - Jan 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
643	20220126	5.2 Update on Judicial Review 18.01.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
644	20220126	6.1 Risk register V10 21_November '21_SMT 8th Nov '21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
645	20220126	8.1 Mins of ARC Meeting December 1st 2021_Chair & Member Feedback Applied	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
646	20220126	8.2 SHR Sub-comm Meeting Minutes-13th Dec 2021-Chair_20220113	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
647	20220126	9.1.1 Lough Ree Draft Net Applications 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
648	20220126	9.1.2 Lough Ree Draft netting byelaw 284 of 2006 and 1954 byelaw	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
649	20220126	9.1.3 Slevin vs ShRFB Lough Ree Case 1995	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
650	20220126	9.2 Habitats and conservation projects 2022 revised tables_Issued 24th Jan	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
651	20220126	9.3 Projects in Other categories 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
652	20220126	9.4.1 Fisheries IceHouse Centre_outline_Proposal MoC 18 1 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
653	20220126	9.4.2 ICE House Galway project - outline proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
654	20220126	9.5.1 Cong Canal Grating Upgrade	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
655	20220126	9.5.2 Envelope1.Suitability	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
656	20220126	9.5.3 Envelope2.Technical	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
657	20220126	10.1 Report on Funding Outcomes	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
658	20220126	10.2 Conservation and Habitats Dec 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
659	20220126	10.3 Other categories Dec 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
660	20220126	10.4 Monthly Protection Plan Review -Nov 21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
661	20220126	10.5 Monthly Protection Plan Review - Dec 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
662	20220126	10.6 Upper Suck Electro Fishing and Redds Jan 2022_Prep'd EF	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
663	20220126	10.7 Response to Queries Trailers_Jan 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
664	20220126	13.1 Guidance on Barrier Removal for River Restoration EU Commission	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
665	20220302	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 02 March 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
666	20220302	0.2 AGENDA_02 March 2022_v2	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
667	20220302	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meeting Report - January 26th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
668	20220302	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising January 26th 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
669	20220302	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_January 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
670	20220302	2.3.1 Letter Min Ryan TD to S Coady - Term of Appointment 28 Jan 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
671	20220302	2.3.2 Letter Min Ryan TD to Min McConalogue TD 25 Jan 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
672	20220302	2.3.3 Letter BDA to IFI 22 Feb 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
673	20220302	2.3.4 Climate Mandate Report_Jan 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
674	20220302	3.1.1 DRAFT Budget 2022 - Briefing Note	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
675	20220302	3.1.2 DRAFT Budget 2022 - Forecast	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
676	20220302	3.2.1 DRAFT Business Plan 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
677	20220302	3.2.2 DRAFT Business Plan 2022 - Dashboard	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
678	20220302	3.4.1 BW Legal Advice - Implementation of Recommendations	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
679	20220302	4.1.1 Executive Summary December 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
680	20220302	4.1.2 Management Accounts December 21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
681	20220302	4.2.1 Executive Summary of January '22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
682	20220302	4.2.2 Management Accounts January 22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
683	20220302	5.1 CEO Report Feb 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

684	20220302	6.1 Risk register V10 22_January 26th Brd Mtg	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
685	20220302	8.1 National Fisheries Protection Plan 2022 V1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
686	20220302	8.2 Galway Fishery CPO - Feb 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
687	20220302	8.3 Sponsorship Award Proposals 2022 FINAL	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
688	20220302	8.4 DRAFT Review of Dormant Accounts Funding	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
689	20220302	8.5 DRAFT Review of IFI R&D including EU Programmes	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
690	20220302	8.6 DRAFT Review of Internal Financial Controls	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
691	20220302	8.7 DRAFT Review of HR and Workforce Planning	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
692	20220302	8.8 2021 - Review of Previous Recommendations from Int Audit	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
693	20220302	8.9 DRAFT Reviewed IFI Board Terms of Reference V1.0	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
694	20220302	8.10 DRAFT Reviewed Matters for Decision of the IFI Board V3.0	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
695	20220302	8.11 DRAFT Reviewed Code of Business Conduct for Directors	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
696	20220302	10.1 Measuring the outcome of Funded projects rev 4_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
697	20220302	10.2 Monthly Protection Plan Review - Jan 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
698	20220308	0.2 AGENDA_08 March 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
699	20220308	2.3.4 Letter from DECC to Chairman IFI re DAF 04.03.22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
700	20220308	2.3.5 Letter from DHLGH to CEO re SACs 02.03.22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
701	20220308	3.1.1 Updated Budget Briefing Note VIIa	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
702	20220308	3.1.2 Training budget 2022 - Final 01.12.21	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
703	20220308	3.2.1 DRAFT Updated Business Plan 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
704	20220308	8.1 National Fisheries Protection Plan 2022 V1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
705	20220308	8.1.1 VFM Patrols Report_20210302	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
706	20220308	8.2 Galway Fishery CPO - Feb 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
707	20220308	8.3 Sponsorship Award Proposals 2022 FINAL	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
708	20220308	8.4 DRAFT Review of Dormant Accounts Funding	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
709	20220308	8.5 DRAFT Review of IFI R&D including EU Programmes	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
710	20220308	8.6 DRAFT Review of Internal Financial Controls	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
711	20220308	8.7 DRAFT Review of HR and Workforce Planning	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
712	20220308	8.8 2021 - Review of Previous Recommendations from Int Audit	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
713	20220308	8.9 DRAFT Reviewed IFI Board Terms of Reference V1.0	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
714	20220308	8.10 DRAFT Reviewed Matters for Decision of the IFI Board V3.0	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
715	20220308	8.11 DRAFT Reviewed Code of Business Conduct for Directors	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
716	20220308	10.1 Measuring the outcome of Funded projects rev 4_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
717	20220308	10.2 Monthly Protection Plan Review - Jan 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
718	20220330	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 30 March 2022_Document Listing	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
719	20220330	0.2 AGENDA_Draft_30 March 2022_Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
720	20220330	2.2.1 Board Meetings Resolutions_February 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
721	20220330	2.2.2 Board Meetings Actns Arising_March 2nd & 8th 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
722	20220330	2.3.1 20220311_Complaint to Minister	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
723	20220330	2.3.2 20220311_Complaint to Minister_Comment from P Nugent	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
724	20220330	2.3.3 20210723_Letter from IFI Chair to Minister Eamon Ryan DECC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
725	20220330	2.3.4 20220304_Letter to Chairman IFI re Dormant Accounts Fund	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
726	20220330	2.3.5 CLIMATEMANDATE_Feb2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
727	20220330	3.1 CEO Report March 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
728	20220330	4.1.1 Executive Summary of February '22 B_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
729	20220330	4.1.2 Board accounts February22_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
730	20220330	5.1 IFI Gov and Int Control Statement 2021_C&AG	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
731	20220330	5.2 IFI 2021 C&AG DRAFT Financial Statements	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
732	20220330	5.3 IFI OCAG Audit Management Letter 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
733	20220330	6.1 Risk register V10 23_March 8th Brd Mtg - Amended	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
734	20220330	6.2 ICT Risk Register_March 2022_V2	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
735	20220330	7.1 IFI Business Development Report v1.1 23022022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
736	20220330	7.2.1 IFI Business Continuity Plan March 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
737	20220330	7.2.2 ICT Disaster Recovery Plan 2021 v0.1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
738	20220330	8.1 Mins of ARC Meeting February 9th 2022_APPRVD March 21st 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
739	20220330	8.2 Annual Report of the Audit Risk Committee 2021_Approved 9th February 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
740	20220330	8.3 Review of Effectiveness ARC 2022_Adopted by ARC 21st March	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
741	20220330	9.1 Habitats and Conservation Funding for 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
742	20220330	10.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - Feb 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
743	20220330	CEO Strategic update March 2022 29.03.22 Presentation	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
744	20220330	CEO Summary Presentation March 2022 29.03.22 Presentation	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
745	20220420	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 20th April 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
746	20220420	1.1 Letter to Chair of IFI - 7 April	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
747	20220420	2.3 Permit Price Recommendations 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
748	20220420	Letter from IFI Board to P. Nugent (April 7th Lt)	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
749	20220427	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 27 April 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
750	20220427	0.2 AGENDA_Draft_27 April 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
751	20220427	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meeting Report - March 2nd, 8th & 30th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
752	20220427	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_March 30th 2022_updated 14th April	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
753	20220427	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_March 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
754	20220427	2.3.1 20220324_Ballisodare Fishing Club - Water Levels	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
755	20220427	2.3.2 Climate Mandate_Mar2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
756	20220427	3.1 CEO Report April 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
757	20220427	4.1 DRAFT IFI AR 2021 v1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
758	20220427	4.2 DRAFT Chairman's Comprehensive Report to the Minister - 2021_DECC	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
759	20220427	5.1.1 Habitats and Conservation Funding for 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
760	20220427	5.1.2 Minister Ryan Annacotty 11.03.2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
761	20220427	5.2 L-Inland Fisheries Ireland 14.4.22 re Amendments to Proceedings Draft	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

762	20220427	6.1 Risk register V10 23_March 8th Brd Mtg - Amended	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
763	20220427	7.1 Q1 Business Plan Update - April 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
764	20220427	8.1 ARC Meeting March 21st 2022_Draft Approved by Email	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
765	20220427	8.2 Property Sub-comm Meeting April 7th 2022_Draft Approved by Email	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
766	20220427	9.1 Commercial Salmon Licence Applications 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
767	20220427	9.2 ORIS 2022 Funding Application	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
768	20220427	9.3 Seasonal Vehicle Hire Proposal	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
769	20220427	10.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - March 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
770	20220427	10.2 National Seizure Report 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
771	20220427	FOR INFO - NWRBD Green Team_final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
772	20220629	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 29 June 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
773	20220629	0.2 DRAFT Agenda_ 29 June 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
774	20220629	2.1.4 DRAFT Board Meeting Report - April 27th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
775	20220629	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_April 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
776	20220629	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_April 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
777	20220629	2.3.1 Member Submission - Habitats Directive - MLH	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
778	20220629	2.3.2 Francis O_Donnell-L-20.05.2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
779	20220629	2.3.3.1 20220615_WO'C WFD weirs	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
780	20220629	2.3.3.2 20220615_WO'C WFD weirs-Previous corresp w A Cullagh	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
781	20220629	2.3.3.3 202201-05_WO'C Correspondence - Annacotty weir	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
782	20220629	2.3.3.4 20220616_FW WO'C WFD weirs	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
783	20220629	2.3.4 Climate Mandate_May 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
784	20220629	3.1 CEO Report June 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
785	20220629	4.1.1 Management Accounts Exec Summary May 22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
786	20220629	4.1.2 Management Accounts May 22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
787	20220629	4.2.1 Quarterly Executive Summary of Q1 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
788	20220629	4.2.2 Q1 Jan - Mar 2022 Accounts	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
789	20220629	4.3 DRAFT Capital Plan 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
790	20220629	4.4 Bank Mandate May 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
791	20220629	5.1 DRAFT IFI Internal Audit Programme 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
792	20220629	5.2 IFI NBP - Initial Barrier Prioritisation	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
793	20220629	5.3 IFI ARC query_Macroinvertebrates and Jute matting_November 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
794	20220629	6.1 Risk register V10 25_June 20th_Chairs_Sec	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
795	20220629	7.1.1 20220510_Mins of ARC Meeting May 10th - Meeting 1_APPRVD 15th June	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
796	20220629	8.1 Commercial Salmon Licence Late Application bf May 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
797	20220629	8.2 Final - Wild Salmon and Sea Trout Statistics Report 2021 bf May 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
798	20220629	9.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - May 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
799	20220629	9.2 Mode of Delivery of Development Projects bf May 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
800	20220629	9.3 Development Project Progress Report Q1 bf May 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
801	20220629	For Info_Cong Hatchery 2018 - Dec 2021_Not for release	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
802	20220629	For Info_Galway Fishery 2019 v 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
803	20220629	For Info_Training Budget 2022 - Final as per 20.04.22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
804	20220907	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 07 Sept 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
805	20220907	0.2 DRAFT Agenda_ 07 Sept 2022 - Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
806	20220907	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meeting Report - June 29th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
807	20220907	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_June 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
808	20220907	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_June 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
809	20220907	2.3 Board Member Request - ML Heffernan - August 16th 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
810	20220907	3.1 CEO Report Sept 2022_Prep'd_Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
811	20220907	4.1.1 Executive Summary of June '22 pd FINAL_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
812	20220907	4.1.2 Board accounts June 22_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
813	20220907	4.1.3 Appendix 1 - Development Costs_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
814	20220907	4.1.4 Executive Summary of July '22_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
815	20220907	4.1.5 Board accounts July 22_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
816	20220907	4.1.6 Appendix 1 - Development Costs FINAL	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
817	20220907	4.2.1 Quarterly Executive Summary of Q2 2022 PDOhe	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
818	20220907	4.2.2 Q2 Jan - June 2022 Accounts_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
819	20220907	4.3 Capital Plan 2022 25.8.22_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
820	20220907	4.4.1 Business Case Purchase of Towing 4x4s Final August 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
821	20220907	4.4.2 Board Capital Expenditure Approval - Vehicles August 2022 MC Signed	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
822	20220907	4.5.1 Excerpt_From_Cong_and_Cornamona_Review_Final-April_2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
823	20220907	4.5.2 20220308_Board_DECC Meeting Minutes-Excerpt	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
824	20220907	4.5.3 20210430_Board Meeting Minutes - Excerpt	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
825	20220907	4.6.1 Drogheda Field Base Property Priority – Business Case	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
826	20220907	5.1 Final Q2 Business Plan Update - Sept 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
827	20220907	5.1.1 Final Q2 Business Plan Update - Sept 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
828	20220907	5.1.2 Q2 Business Plan Update Sept 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
829	20220907	6.1 Risk register V10.27 Updated 19.07.22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
830	20220907	7.1.1 Mins of ARC Meeting June 15th 2022_Approved by Email	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
831	20220907	7.1.2 220725 IFI Internal Audit Programme 2022 - V2 Draft	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
832	20220907	7.2 Property Sub-comm Meeting Minutes - 31st August - Approved by Email	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
833	20220907	8.1 Electric Vehicles Strategy Draft for Board V0.1_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
834	20220907	8.2 DRAFT IFI Energy Policy V0.1 Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
835	20220907	8.3 DRAFT B01 IFI Board Terms of Reference V1.1_Appr'd_2nd Mar '22-UPDATED Sept '22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
836	20220907	8.4 DRAFT IFI Board Secretariat Terms of Reference V0.1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
837	20220907	8.5 DRAFT B11 Board Expenses Policy Procedure_Sept 22_V2.1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

838	20220907	8.6 DRAFT F02 IFI Foreign Travel Policy and Procedure _UPDTD SEPT '22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
839	20220907	9.1.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - June 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
840	20220907	9.1.2 Monthly Protection Plan Review - July 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
841	20220907	9.2 Development Project Progress Report Q2	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
842	20220907	9.3 Climate Mandate August 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
843	20220907	FOR INFO_Climate Change Mitigation Research Programme Report_2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
844	20220907	FOR INFO_Response to Jute Matting Queries 12_8_22_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
845	20221014	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 14th October 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
846	20221014	0.2 Agenda_14 Oct 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
847	20221014	2.1.1 Letter to Chair IFI - Bradley Report Sept 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
848	20221014	2.1.2 SC Bradley's Report - 12 July 2022_Searchable Version	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
849	20221014	2.1.3 SC Bradley Report - Recommendations for Consideration	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
850	20221014	3.1 Risk register V10.27 Updated 19.07.22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
851	20221014	FOR INFO_B01 IFI Board Terms of Reference V1.0_Brd Apprvd_20220302	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
852	20221014	FOR INFO_B02 Matters for Decision of the Board of IFI_Brd Apprvd_20220302	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
853	20221014	FOR INFO_B03 IFI Code of Business Conduct for the Board of IFI_Brd Apprvd 20220302	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
854	20221014	FOR INFO_IPA Assurance Map - 2015	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
855	20221019	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 19th October 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
856	20221019	0.2 DRAFT Agenda_19 Oct 2022_Updated 18th Oct	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
857	20221019	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meeting Report - Sept 7th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
858	20221019	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_Sept 7th_As at 20221011	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
859	20221019	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_Sept 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
860	20221019	3.1 CEO's Report Oct 2022 Final_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
861	20221019	4.1.1 Management Accounts - Executive Summary - August 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
862	20221019	4.1.2 August 2022 - Mangement Accounts_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
863	20221019	4.2.1 Vehicle Procurement Further Information for Decision_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
864	20221019	4.2.2 APPROVED Electric Vehicles Strategy V1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
865	20221019	4.2.3 FOR INFO_Board Cap Ex Appraisal - Electric Vehicles	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
866	20221019	4.2.4 FOR INFO_Business Case Purchase of Towing 4x4s	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
867	20221019	4.3 221013 DRAFT Terms of Reference for Watercraft Fleet Review 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
868	20221019	5.1 IFI Workforce Plan and Business Case July 2022_final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
869	20221019	6.1 IFI Risk Register V10.27 Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
870	20221019	8.1 Habitats & Conservation Projects - 2023 Funding Grant for Decisionl_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
871	20221019	8.2.1 Recommendations of Feasibility Study - Aasleagh Estate for Decision_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
872	20221019	8.2.2 Feasibility Study - Aasleagh Lodge & Erriff Fishery - Vol 1 of 3 to IFI 27 Feb 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
873	20221019	8.2.3 Aasleagh Lodge Architecture Report - Vol 2 of 3 to IFI 27 Feb 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
874	20221019	8.2.4 Aasleagh Lodge Environmental Audit - Vol 3 of 3 to IFI 27 Feb 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
875	20221019	8.3 Louisburgh Site Visit and Proposal to Sell - for Decision_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
876	20221019	9.1.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - August 22_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
877	20221019	9.2 Development Project Progress Report Q3_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
878	20221019	9.3 CLIMATE MANDATE_Oct 2022_Prep'd from Start	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
879	20221019	9.4 Analysis of Rivers of SWRBD under State Control where Habitat Restrtrn is Required_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
880	20221019	9.5 IFI 10 RBD Development Projects - Presentation Slide Deck_UPDATED	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
881	20221019	9.6 IFI National Barriers Project Board Update Autumn 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
882	20221019	FOR INFO_IFI Bluefin Tuna CHART 2022 mid-season report 5th Oct 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
883	20221019	FOR INFO_IFI Marine Recreational Fishing Pilot study report_V2_rev_2022_FINAL	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
884	20221019	FOR INFO_IFI NSIC R Erriff Atlantic Salmon Fry Translocation Project Non-technical Project Summary	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
885	20221122	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 22-23 November 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
886	20221122	0.2 Agenda_22_23 Nov 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
887	20221122	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meeting Report - Oct 19th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
888	20221122	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_Oct 19th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
889	20221122	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_Oct 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
890	20221122	2.3.1 20221028 IFI Letter from Minister Ryan to CEO	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
891	20221122	2.3.2 Board and SMT Interviews undertaken by Intrinsic Management_Q1 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
892	20221122	3.1 CEO Report November 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
893	20221122	4.1.1 Management Accounts - Executive Summary - September 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
894	20221122	4.1.2 Management Accounts - September 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
895	20221122	4.2.1 Quarterly Executive Summary of FS Q3 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
896	20221122	4.2.2 Financial Accounts Q3 - Jan-Sept 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
897	20221122	5.1.1 Final Q3 Business Plan Update -Nov 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
898	20221122	6.1 Corporate Risk Register 10.28_FF Added	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
899	20221122	7.2.1 Terms of Reference - New Fish Farm Project Steering Group	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
900	20221122	7.2.2 Fish Farm Design Programme Draft 1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
901	20221122	7.2.3 New IFI Fish Farm Project Steering Group Meeting 19-07-22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
902	20221122	7.2.4 IFI Fish Farm Project Steering Group Meeting Minutes 19-08-22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
903	20221122	8.1.1 Proposed Access Project - Decommited Funds - November 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
904	20221122	8.2.1 Sponsorship Programme Proposal - 2023_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A

905	20221122	8.3.1 Permit Recommendations 2023_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
906	20221122	8.4.1 SWRBD Licence Distributor Proposal_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
907	20221122	9.1.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - September 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
908	20221122	9.1.2 Monthly Protection Plan Review - October 22_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
909	20221122	9.2.1 Climate Mandate - October 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
910	20221122	10.1 Board Meeting Schedule_2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
911	20221214	0.1 COVER LETTER Board Meeting - 14 December 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
912	20221214	0.2 Agenda_ 14 December 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
913	20221214	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meeting Report - Nov 22 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
914	20221214	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_Nov 22nd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
915	20221214	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_Nov 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
916	20221214	2.3.1 Galway City Council to CEO - 5 December 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
917	20221214	2.3.2 Email from CEO to DECC in Response to Request for Accommodation	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
918	20221214	3.1 CEO's Report December 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
919	20221214	4.1.1 DRAFT Audited Financial Statements 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
920	20221214	4.1.2 Int Control Statement 2021_13 Dec 22 - Internal Control Issues - Pages 17 - 26	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
921	20221214	4.2.1 Management Accounts - Executive Summary - October 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
922	20221214	4.2.2 Management Accounts - October 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
923	20221214	4.3.1 Striking of the Fishery Rate 2023_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
924	20221214	7.2.1 National Inland Fisheries Forum - Terms of Reference 26.05.22	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
925	20221214	7.2.2 National Inland Fisheries Forum - Meeting Minutes May 30 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
926	20221214	8.1.1 Cover Board Paper - IFI Innovation Strategy V1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
927	20221214	8.1.2 IFI Innovation Strategy V1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
928	20221214	Stakeholder Engagement Strategy	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
929	20221214	8.2.2 IFI External Comms & Stakeholder Engagement Strategy and Appendices	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
930	20221214	8.3.1 Cover Sheet Board Paper - Draft IFI Consultation Policy	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
931	20221214	8.3.2 IFI Public Consultation Policy Doc V2.1	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
932	20221214	8.4.1 Cover Sheet Board Paper - Draft IFI Irish Language Scheme	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
933	20221214	8.4.2 Irish language scheme IFI Draft Final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
934	20221214	8.5.1 World Recreational Fishing Conference 11 2026	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
935	20221214	9.1.1 Letter to IFI (EFortune) re verification of the IFI Code Checklist for 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
936	20221214	FOR INFO 1 - Encyclopedia of Inland waters_freshwater fisheries_final chapter	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
937	20221214	FOR INFO 2 - The vulnerability of Ireland's freshwater fish to climate change_Barryetal_2022 (003)	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
938	20221214	FOR INFO 3 - Learning through the Landscape 2020	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
939	20220126	20220126_Board Meeting Minutes - January 26th_APPRVD Mar 2nd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
940	20220302	20220302_Board Meeting Minutes - March 2nd_APPRVD Mar 30th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
941	20220308	20220308_Board Meeting Minutes - March 8th_AMNDD_APPROVD Mar 30th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
942	20220330	20220330_Board Meeting Minutes - March 30th_AMNDMNTS APPRVD June 29th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
943	20220420	20220420_Board Meeting Minutes - April 20th_AMNDMNTS APPRVD June 29th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
944	20220427	20220427_Board Meeting Minutes - April 27th_AMNDMNTS APPRVD June 29th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
945	20220629	20220629_Board Meeting Minutes - June 29th_AMNDMNTS APPRVD Sept 7th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
946	20220907	20220907_Board Meeting Minutes - Sept 7th_APPRVD Oct 19th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
947	20221014	20221014_Board Meeting Minutes - Oct 14th_APPRVD Oct 19th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
948	20221019	20221019_Board Meeting Minutes - Oct 19th_APPRVD Nov 22nd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
949	20221122	20221122_Board Meeting Minutes - November 22nd_APPRVD Dec 14th	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
950	20221214	20221214_Board Meeting Minutes - December 14th_NOTED Mar 9th 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
951	20230309	0.1 s.18 Appointee Meeting Cover Letter_9 March 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
952	20230309	0.2 s.18 Appointee Meeting Agenda_9 March 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
953	20230309	2.1.2 DRAFT Board Meeting Report for Distribution to Staff- Dec 14th 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
954	20230309	2.2.1 Board Meetings Actns Arising_Updated 17th Jan	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
955	20230309	2.2.2 Board Meetings Resolutions_Dec 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
956	20230309	3.1.1 Summary Business Plan Report 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
957	20230309	3.1.2 Business Plan 2022 - Individual Division Actions	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
958	20230309	3.2.1 DRAFT Business Plan 2023 - Individual Division Actions	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
959	20230309	3.3.1 DRAFT National Fisheries Protection Plan 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
960	20230309	3.4.1 DRAFT Operations Development Plan 2023_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
961	20230309	3.5.1 DRAFT DECC IFI Oversight Agreement 2023 - 2025	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
962	20230309	3.5.2 DRAFT DECC IFI Performance Delivery Agreement 2023 - 2025	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
963	20230309	3.5.3 DRAFT IFI PDA - Performance Metrics 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
964	20230309	4.1.1 CEO Report March 2023 Final	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
965	20230309	5.1.1 DRAFT IFI Gov and Int Control Statement 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
966	20230309	5.1.2 DRAFT IFI Financial Statements 28.2.23 (CAG) 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
967	20230309	5.2.1 DRAFT IFI Gov and Int Control Statement 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
968	20230309	5.2.2 DRAFT IFI Financial Statements (CAG) 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
969	20230309	5.3.1 DRAFT IFI Budget 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
970	20230309	5.4.1 DRAFT IFI Capital Plan 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
971	20230309	5.5.1 Seasonal Headcount 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
972	20230309	5.6.1 Board Capital Expenditure Appraisal - Fish counters_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
973	20230309	5.8.1 Louisburgh Site Visit and Proposal to Sell - for Information	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
974	20230309	6.1.1 Corporate Risk Register 10.30	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A



975	20230309	9.1.1 Climate Mandate Report for Dec 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
976	20230309	9.2.1 Development Projects Progress Report Q4_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
977	20230309	9.3.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - November 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
978	20230309	9.3.2 Monthly Protection Plan Review - December 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
979	20230309	FOR INFO_1 Inland Fisheries Ireland - Protected Disclosures 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
980	20230309	FOR INFO_2 Presentation to S18 Appointees 2023 02 24	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
981	20230329	0.1 Index of Papers_29 March 2023@ 27th March	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
982	20230329	0.2 Agenda_29 March 2023@ 27th March	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
983	20230329	2.1.2 DRAFT s.18 Appointee Meeting Report - March 9th 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
984	20230329	2.2.1 Meetings Actns Arising_2023@ 21 Mar	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
985	20230329	2.2.2 Meetings Resolutions_2023 @ 9 Mar	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
986	20230329	3.2.1 DRAFT DECC IFI Oversight Agreement 2023 - 2025	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
987	20230329	3.2.2 DRAFT DECC IFI Performance Delivery Agreement 2023 - 2025	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
988	20230329	3.3.1 Presentation to the Board_HR_29 Mar 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
989	20230329	3.3.2 IFI HR Review V1.0_Clarion_17 Oct 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
990	20230329	3.3.3 HR Interim Strategy_Final_2018 to 2019	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
991	20230329	3.3.4 IFI Workforce Plan and Business Case July 2022 _Mazars	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
992	20230329	3.3.5 Org Restructure & Workforce Plan_HR Sub Committee_6 Dec 2021	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
993	20230329	3.4.2 2020 IFI IT Strategy Security and Resilience Internal Audit Review	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
994	20230329	3.4.3 2020 IFI IT Internal Audit Recommendations - Follow Up	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
995	20230329	3.5.1 Habitats and Conservation Funding for 2023 Board Submission	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
996	20230329	4.1.1 CEO Report 29th March 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
997	20230329	5.1.1 DRAFT IFI Gov and Int Control Statement 2022 - C&AG	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
998	20230329	5.1.2 DRAFT IFI Financial Statements 2022 - C&AG	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
999	20230329	5.2.1 Budget Presentation 2023 - 20 March	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1000	20230329	5.2.2 Finance Briefing Note 2023_Updated	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1001	20230329	5.2.3.1 IFI Property Protocols	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1002	20230329	5.2.3.2 Review of IFI Properties - 2014, 2021, 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1003	20230329	5.2.3.3 2017 - National Property Listing_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1004	20230329	5.2.3.4 2017 - Actioned Property Listing 1st Wave_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1005	20230329	5.3.1 Management Accounts - January 2023 - Exec Summ	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1006	20230329	5.3.2 Management Accounts - January 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1007	20230329	6.1.1 Risk Management Policy_V 3.2_Dec '21 - Board Apprvd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1008	20230329	6.1.2 Corporate Risk Register 10.30	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1009	20230329	8.1.1 DRAFT IFI Corporate Procurement Plan 2023-2025	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1010	20230329	8.1.2 DRAFT IFI Corporate Procurement Policy	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1011	20230329	8.2.1 Conservation Measure funding_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1012	20230329	8.3.1 DRAFT Policy on Grant Administration v2	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1013	20230329	8.3.2 DRAFT TOR for Evaluation Committees	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1014	20230329	8.4.1 Recommendation to Sell IFI Property at Ballybane, Galway City	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1015	20230329	9.1.1 IFI Climate Mandate Report - February 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1016	20230329	9.2.1 Monthly Protection Plan Review - Jan 23	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1017	20230329	9.2.2 Monthly Protection Plan Review - Feb 23	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1018	20230329	FOR INFO 1_EIFAAC Proceedings From IFI DECC Symposium 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1019	20230329	FOR INFO 2_Electric Vehicles Strategy - Work to Date_March23	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1020	20230329	FOR INFO 3_Fishcounter Annual Report 2022 - March 23_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1021	20230329	FOR INFO 4_Fisheries Protection - Seizures Report 2022_Prep'd	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1022	20230329	FOR INFO 5_Approved NIFF Meeting Minutes - 14th November 2022	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1023	20230309	20230309_s18 Appointee (Board) Meeting Minutes - March 9th_Agreed 29 Mar 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A
1024	20230329	20230329_s18 Appointee Meeting Minutes - March 29th_Agreed 19 April 2023	Refuse	9.(2)a	N/A	N/A